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WISH LIST OF EQUIPMENT AND CONSUMABLES FOR PREPARATION IN CASE OF DISASTERS 

 

 Equipment and consumables for disasters 
 

Number of units NOTES 

1  Shelters to be used as consult and hospital  Used or new 

1 Military tents (for shelter or consult) 6 Used or new 

2 Portable cots 20 Used or new 

3 Portable mattresses and air pumping equipment 6 Used or new 

4 Sleeping provisions (blankets, pillows, etc.) 20 Used or new 

5 Self-loading stretcher with adjustable heights to be 
use in the ambulance, and  as manage medical care 
for patient  

3 Used or new 

6 Emergency and rescue stretcher to be used as 
procedure tables and for ambulance 

3 Used or new 

7 Primary communication system for emergency 
management (portable radios, cell phones with 
two‐way radio capabilities, etc.) 6 

Used or new 

8 Resident identification system and tracking system 
(wristband system or similar system, including 
tracking logs) 2 box 

Used or new 

9 Equipment needed to boil large volumes of water 
(adequate supply of large pots, commercial cooking 
kettles, etc.) 2 kits x 50 people 

Used or new 

10 Water purification tablets (halazone) 1000 tabs   

11 Equipment and containers available to transport 
food supplies 2 kits x 50 people 

Used or new 

12 Portable chairs and tables for evacuation 
relocation/staging 25 

Used or new 

13  Oxygen concentrators 6 Used or new 

14 Oxygen tanks (portable) 6 Used or new 

15 Portable IV poles (collapsible) 20 Used or new 

16 Suction machines (manual and electric) 6 Used or new 

17 Portable commodes 6 Used or new 

18 Containers (like five‐gallon buckets/heavy duty 
garbage bags) for sanitation 6 

Used or new 

    

2 Protection for current infrastructure   

1 Heavy‐duty plastic sheeting to block windows, 
doors, air ducts, etc. during hazardous conditions 
outside facility 5 box 

Used or new 



2 Rope caulking to seal doors/windows 5 box Used or new 

3 Tarps 20 Used or new 

4 Heavy‐duty scissors 4 Used or new 

5 Tape, various types—duct, masking, transparent, 
packing, etc. 5 box 

Used or new 

6 Yellow “Caution” tape 5 rolls Used or new 

7 Standard tool boxes (wrenches, screwdrivers, 
hammers, pliers, etc.) in various locations 
throughout the facility 1 kit 

Used or new 

8 Various power tools (drill, saws, awl, etc.) 1 kit Used or new 

9 Electrical wiring kit (various connectors, caps, 
terminals, electrical snips, etc.) 2 kits 

Used or new 

10 Various types of rope and twine 5 box Used or new 

11 Wire for binding 5 roll Used or new 

12 Specialized digging tools (picks, shovels, axe, etc.)  1 kit Used or new 

13 Wet/dry vacuums 2 Used or new 

14 Commercial / heavy duty fans 6 Used or new 

15 Commercial/heavy duty portable de‐humidifiers 2 Used or new 

16 Portable water pump 2 Used or new 

17 Appropriately sized hoses for portable water pumps 2 kits Used or new 

18 Ladders 3 Used or new 

19 Hard hats 6 Used or new 

20 Dust/filter‐type masks 1 box Used or new 

21 Eye protection (goggles, safety glasses, etc.) 20 Used or new 

22 Siphon pumps 6 Used or new 

23 Gas‐powered chain saw for tree removal 1 Used or new 

24 Approved heavy‐duty extension cords 6 Used or new 

25 Battery‐chargers 3 Used or new 

26 Portable generators (in addition to facility 
generator) 1 

Used or new 

27 Fire extinguishers 6 Used or new 

    

3 Trauma equipment   

1 Leg immobilizers 3 New or used 

2 Head immobilizers adult and children 3 New or used 

3 Shoulder immobilizers 3 New or used 

4 Knee immobilizers 3 New or used 

5 Pediatric immobilizer 1 New or used 

6 Spine immobilizers 2 kits New or used 

7 Body splint immobilizer 2 kits New or used 

    

4 Education training equipment   

 Dummies for CPR 1 Used or new 

    

5 Consumables   

1 Medical/first‐aid supplies to sustain operations for 1 pallet New 



at least five days  

2 Dust/filter‐type masks 100 x box x 5 New 

3 Medical sterile globes nitrile 50 x box x 30 New 

4 Exam globes nitrile 100 x box x 30 New 

5 Disposable gowns 50 x  box x 5 New 

6 Sterile sheets and camps 50 x  box x 5 New 

7 Disposable suture equipment  10 x box x 20 New 

8  Disposable stiches extraction 10 x box x 5 New 

9 Red bags for bio‐waste disposal 50 x box x 10 New 

10 Disposable masks various sizes 50 x box x 10 New 

11 Eye protection (goggles, safety glasses, etc.) 50 x box x 5 New 

12 Cold packs/ ice packs 5 boxes New 

13 Insect repellant 5 boxes New 

14 Body bags 10 New 

15 Flashlights and battery‐operated lanterns 10 New 

16 Self‐illuminating light sticks 50 New 

17 Bull horn or portable public address communication 
device 

2 Used or new 

18 Battery‐operated AM/FM radios 2 Used or new 

 


